

Inpatient mental health rehabilitation services - FOI Answ

NHS Trust: Isle
 Date: _____

1. Please supply the name, email address and telephone number of the commissioner with responsibility for inpatient mental health rehabilitation services.	Name
<i>Response - Isle of Wight CCG. All available details are readily available on their website. www.isleofwightccg.nhs.uk</i>	
2. Please provide the total number of adults in inpatient mental health rehabilitation services. <i>Number of Admissions. These figures relate to Trust rehab service only. The commissioners also make use of mainland rehab providers for Island residents.</i>	2013/14
Total number	18
3. Of the total number of adults in inpatient mental health rehabilitation services (q.2) please provide the number that are; <i>Number of Admissions. These figures relate to Trust rehab service only. The commissioners also make use of mainland rehab providers for Island residents.</i>	2013/14
Male	12
Female	6
4. Of the total number of adults in inpatient mental health rehabilitation services (q.2) please provide the number that were;	2013/14
<i>Woodlands is an open rehab and is the only NHS rehab on the Island. Any independent/locked rehab placements would be mainland placements and the CCG would be placing the patients therefore the IOW Trust do not hold this information and you may wish to redirect your enquiry to the IOW CCG. www.isleofwightccg.nhs.uk</i>	
5. Of the total number of adults in inpatient mental health rehabilitation services (q.2) please provide the number that were placed in;	2013/14
<i>This information is not held by the Trust. You may wish to redirect your enquiry to the Isle of Wight CCG. www.isleofwightccg.nhs.uk</i>	
6. Of the total number of adults in inpatient mental health rehabilitation services (q.2) please provide the number that were placed in;	2013/14
<i>This information is not held by the Trust. You may wish to redirect your enquiry to the Isle of Wight CCG. www.isleofwightccg.nhs.uk</i>	
7. What is the average length of stay in adult inpatient mental health rehabilitation services? <i>Based on those Discharged that year. NB These figures relate to the Trust rehab unit only.</i>	2013/14
Average length of stay	141 Days
8. What is the highest and lowest recorded daily/weekly (please specify which value is included in your response) fee for an adult inpatient mental health rehabilitation service placement?	2013/14
<i>Response - The Trust do not hold this information. You may wish to redirect this part of your enquiry to the Isle of Wight CCG. www.isleofwightccg.nhs.uk</i>	
Lowest daily/weekly fee	

9. Please provide the total expenditure on adult mental health inpatient mental health rehabilitation service placements for each of the financial years 2013/14 to 2015/16, and where possible, budgeted expenditure for 2016/17.	2013/14
Response - The Trust do not hold this information. You may wish to redirect this part of your enquiry to the Isle of Wight CCG. www.isleofwightccg.nhs.uk	
10. Please provide a list of providers (both NHS and private hospitals) that received this funding (q.9).	2013/14
Response - The Trust do not hold this information. May we suggest that you redirect this part of your enquiry to the Isle of Wight CCG. www.isleofwightccg.nhs.uk	
Private providers	

ers

of Wight NHS Trust
As per email

Job title	Telephone No.	Email Address

2014/15	2015/16	2016/17
5	1	7

2014/15	2015/16	2016/17
4	0	2
1	1	5

2014/15	2015/16	2016/17

2014/15	2015/16	2016/17

2014/15	2015/16	2016/17

2014/15	2015/16	2016/17
325 Days	384 Days	411 Days

2014/15	2015/16	2016/17

2014/15	2015/16	2016/17

2014/15	2015/16	2016/17